From: "Feierstein, Kimberly" <[ RN
To: "Lesley Groff™ <||
Ce: "Rich Kahn" </
Subject: RE: Jeffrey Epstein/{JJili] event
Date: Mon, 12 Nov 2012 21:23:40 +0000

It's perfectly fine to mail it. If you have it brought here all I would do with it iIs have
it walked owver to Event Associates :)

————— Original Message-----—

From: Lesley Groff [m:ailtl:w:—]
Zent: Monday, Hovember 12, 2012 4:1% PM

To: Feierstein, Kimberly

Cz: "Rich Eahn'

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epsteim’.‘:‘; evant

Hi Kimberly...should we have the check brought over teo your office? or just mail it to the
Event Associates peaople?

On WNowv 12, 2012, at 2:24 PM, Feierstein, Himberly wrote:

Fom———- COriginal Message-----
> From: Lesley Groff [mai;tc:_]

» Sent: Monday, November 12, 2012 Z2:23 FM
> To: Felerstein, EKimberly

> Co: Rich Eahn

> Subject: Jeffrey Epstein/JJjE event

-

> Hi Eimberly. Jeffrey would like to buy a table for -‘s evant for 25k...can you please
send us the details so Rich can write the check and I can include the ewvent in Jeffrey's
calendar?

> Thanks, Lesley

> This e-mail message is intended only for the named recipient(s) above. It may contain
confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail and any attachment (s) is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please immediately notify the =sender
by replying to this e-mail and delete the messzage and any attachment({s) from your system.
Thank you.

-
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