From: Darren Indyke *’_
To: Richard Kahn < . | -:'cy Groff <[

Subject: Fwd: September Invoice
Date: Wed, 24 Oct 2012 18:10:40 +0000
Attachments: Epstein_September.pdf

DARREN K. INDYKE

DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - ® 2011 Darren K.

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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Begin forwarded message:

From: Tonja Haddad Coleman <[} -
Date: October 1, 2012 10:28:04 AM EDT

To: Darren Indyke <G

Subject: September Invoice

Hello Darren-

Attached please find September's Invoice. As vou can see, there 1s still a balance in our Trust Account, as we
kept the billing under $10,000.00 this month as promised. Debbie's research and drafting time for the month
appears as a lump-sum entry and was billed at the reduced rate of $125 per hour as agreed. We should have the
draft of our response to the Punitive Damages 1ssue to vou by Wednesday, and an outline of discovery requests
in the next 2 weeks. Bear in mind we have hearings coming up in October regarding the disqualification of
Fred, and as you know when there are court appearances the bill is often larger.

Feel free to contact me if you have any questions.

Tonja Haddad Coleman, E=sq.
Tonia HADDAD, P.A.
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Advocate Building

315 SE 7" Street
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

The information contained in this transmission may conlain privileged and confidential information. 11 is intended only for the use of the person(s) named abave. If
you are not the intended racipient. you are hereby notified that any review, dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If
yau are not tha intended recipient, please contact the sander by reply amail and destroy all copias of the original messaga.
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