
From: <I 

To:  

Subject: RE: Follow Up 

Date: Tue, 16 Oct 2012 14:46:04 +0000 

Inline-Images: image001.gif 

Thanks 

Cliff Stein 

Reputation Changer-CE0 

T: 

D: 

M: 

F: 

From: [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, October 16, 2012 10:45 AM 
To: 
Cc: Rich Kahn; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Follow Up 

I 

Hello Cliff. I know Rich in our accounting dept is on it...thanks, 

On Oct 16, 2012, at 10:40 AM, < > wrote: 

EFTA00402847



Are we ready to get started this morning? I have not seen paperwork come through yet. 

FYI, I sent wire information just in case you guys wanted to make wire payment instead of credit card, but either way is 
fine. If you guys decide you want to do wire payment, you can just fill in all "1"'s in the credit card authorization part of 
the docusign and just wire payment. If you decide to pay with credit card, you can just fill out the docusign 
completely(including the credit card authorization part). 

Thanks 

Cliff Stein 

Reputation Changer-CEO 

D: 

M: 

F: 

<image001.gif> 

From: [mailto: 
Sent: Monda October 15, 2012 7:11 PM 
To: 
Cc: 'Richard Kahn'; 'Bella Klein' 
Subject: RE: Follow Up 

I 

I've attached a copy of our banking information to initiate wire payment. Please let me know once wire payment 
of $12,500.00 is initiated and I'll tell my accounting department to alert me as soon as payment hits our account. 

Thanks 

EFTA00402848



Cliff Stein 

Reputation Changer-CEO 

T: 

D: 

M: 

<image001.gif> 

From: [mailto: 
Sent:  Monday, October 15, 2012 6:22 PM 
To: <I 
Cc: Richard Kahn; Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Follow Up 

Hi Cliff. Jeffrey has approved the charge. What did you need our accounting dept to do? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 15, 2012, at 5:17 PM, < > wrote: 

Thanks =, 

Cliff Stein 

Reputation Changer-CEO 

T: 

D: 

M: 

<image001.gif> 

From: [mailto: 
Sent:  Monday, October 15, 2012 5:16 PM 
To: < 
Subject: Re: Follow Up 
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I have not. Let me see if I can reach him again 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 15, 2012, at 4:31 PM, < > wrote: 

Have you heard back from Jeffrey yet? I want to make sure I get the journalist call penciled in for this evening or 
tomorrow morning if possible. 

Thanks 

Cliff Stein 

Reputation Changer-CEO 

T: 

0: 

M: 

F: 

<image001.gif> 

From: [mailto: 
Sent: Monda October 15 2012 3:12 PM 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: Follow Up 

ok, thank you. I'm sure it is all fine, but I need jeffrey's approval 

myself...hoping he gets back to me asap! 

If we have any problems with the email, we will let you know then. 

Thanks, 

EFTA00402850



On Oct 15, 2012, at 3:04 PM, < wrote: 

gave me your email address and I wanted to check in with you to find out if you were able to successfully fill 
out the docusign for Jeffrey Epstein's campaign. If you are having any problems successfully completing the document 
please call me on my direct line or mobile(numbers listed in my email signature) and I would be happy to walk you 
through it. 

Thanks 

Cliff Stein 

Reputation Changer-CEO 

T: 

0: 

M: 

F: 

<image001.gif> 

<Incoming Wire Instructions-Reputation Changer.pdf> 

EFTA00402851


