
From: ==. > 
To: Ike Groff •t:El > 

Subject: Re: Invoice from HYGENIX. Inc. - 34703 
Date: Mon, 24 Sep 2012 13:37:38 +0000 

They are. Just not answering the door. I am still out here! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 24, 2012, at 9:35 AM, Ike Groff < > wrote: 

> No one there? 

• Original Message 
> From: Imailto• 
> Sent: Monday, September 24, 2012 9:35 AM 
> To: Ike Groff 
> Subject: Re: Invoice from HYGENIX. Inc. - 34703 

> • Yes it is good news. I am standing outside of JE's house for 8 min and no one is letting me 
in! I've called the house and louel's cell! Not making me happy 

> Sent from my iPhone 

> On Sep 24, 2012, at 9:31 AM, Ike Groff .s: > wrote: 

» great 
>> 
>>  Original Message 
>> From: [manta: ] 
>> Sent: Monday, September 24, 2012 9:31 AM 
>> To: Ryan Ebenhack 
>> Cc: Robert Brown; Marlene Drakeford; Ike Groff; Bob Caffrey 
>> Subject: Re: Invoice from HYGENIX. Inc. - 34703 
>> 
>> Ok good to know. Thank you and I hope to see the report as soon as possible. 
>> 
>> Appreciate it 
>> 
>> Sent from my iPhone 
>> 
>> On Sep 24, 2012, at 9:16 AM, Ryan Ebenhack .sz > wrote: 
>> 
>>> I believe my boss bob brown is writing up the final letter - I dont believe there were 
any asbestos or lead issues 
>>> 
>>> Ryan 
>>> 
>>> 
>>> Sent from my iPhone 
>>> 
>» On Sep 24, 2012, at 8:55 AM, wrote: 
>>> 
>>>> I am in great need of our report! I have paid our bill in full and I thought I would 
have the report last Friday? May we please have it today? Ryan, how did we do!? III hoping 
we have no asbestos or lead but if we do we need to start coordinating getting rid of it! 
>>>> 
>>>> Thanks, 
>>>> 917 749 2025 
>>>> 
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>>>> Sent from my iPhone 
»» 
>>>> On Sep 20, 2012, at 11:13 AM, Marlene Drakeford < > wrote: 
»» 
>>>>> Dear Ms. Groff: 
> > > > > 
>>>>> Your report is ready. Attached is Hygenix Invoice 34703 for review and payment. For 
your convenience, we accept Visa or Master Card. Once we receive payment, the inspection 
report and lab analysis will be emailed to you. 
> > > > > 
>>>>> To make a payment, contact me between 8:30 am - 12:00 noon. 
> > > > > 
>>>>> If you have any questions, please contact our technician Ryan Ebenhack at ext. 11. 
> > > > > 
>>>>> Thank you for your business - we appreciate it very much. 
> > > > > 
>»» Sincerely, 
> > > > > 
>»» Marlene Drakeford 
>>>» Accounts Receivable Manager 
>>>» HYGENIX. Inc. 
>»» 49 Woodside Street 
>>>>> Stamford, CT 06902 
> > > > > 
>>>» <Inv_34703_from_HYGENIX._Inc.pdf> 
> > 
> >  
> > 
>> This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended only for the 
person or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, you are 
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail and any 
attachment(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error please 
immediately notify the sender at 203-302-7300 or by replying to this e-mail and delete the e-
mail and any attachment(s) from your system. Nothing herein shall be construed as a financial 
promotion to any person or persons, or a solicitation or recommendation to buy or sell any 
security or other investment or to engage in any trading strategy. Information presented is 
from sources believed to be reliable, but is not guaranteed to be accurate or complete. This 
information should not be taken as an offer nor as a solicitation of an offer to buy or sell 
securities or other financial instruments. Email transmission cannot be guaranteed to be 
secure, timely or error free. Tourmaline Partners, LLC may review and store both incoming and 
outgoing messages. Use by other than the intended recipients is prohibited. 

> This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended only for the 
person or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, you are 
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail and any 
attachment(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error please 
immediately notify the sender at 203-302-7300 or by replying to this e-mail and delete the e-
mail and any attachment(s) from your system. Nothing herein shall be construed as a financial 
promotion to any person or persons, or a solicitation or recommendation to buy or sell any 
security or other investment or to engage in any trading strategy. Information presented is 
from sources believed to be reliable, but is not guaranteed to be accurate or complete. This 
information should not be taken as an offer nor as a solicitation of an offer to buy or sell 
securities or other financial instruments. Email transmission cannot be guaranteed to be 
secure, timely or error free. Tourmaline Partners, LLC may review and store both incoming and 
outgoing messages. Use by other than the intended recipients is prohibited. 

EFTA00404597


