From: Lesley Groff <] -
To: Rebecea Rex <[ G-

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein
Date: Mon, 20 Aug 2012 20:53:14 +0000

Hi Rebecca....Payment is in the works!! Once the check is written, where should we Fed Ex to?

Lesley

On Aug 20, 2012, at 11:48 AM, Rebecca Rex wrote:

Hi there Lesley,

I did forward this question on to RSW - I will find out if they ever connected about this.

Meanwhile, I wonder if vou can give me an update on the status of the invoice RSW sent to JE about his
contribution $100,000 sponsorship of the WWW Conference which we sent on August 6th. Finally, are there

any additional names we should add to JE's list of participants?

Many thanks
Rebecca

REBECCA REX
Assistant to Richard Saul Wurman

18-20 September 2012

On Aug 20, 2012, at 11:40 AM, Lesley Groff wrote:

Hello Rebecca. .. Just following up...I know Jeffrey had asked "why so many Yo Yo Ma?"...do you happen to
know if Jeffrey and RSW ever spoke about this? [ never heard anything back... :)

Lesley
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