
From: 

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: Re: FW: 04AUG12 Dalaman-Kos, pax 1 & Car with Driver in Kos// CHARTER AGREEMENT 

Date: Wed, 01 Aug 2012 16:43:56 +0000 

hopefully JE will give the word ASAP... 

On Wed, Aug 1, 2012 at 12:43 PM, > wrote: 
Allison forwarded me the below message ... 

 Forwarded message 
From: Allison Reddington 
Date: Wed, Aug 1, 2012 at 12:05 PM 
Subject: FW: 04AUG12 Dalaman-Kos, ax 1 & Car with Driver in Kos// CHARTER AGREEMENT 
1'o: ' < e0 

FYI 

From: Miltos Mouzakis [mailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, August 01, 2012 12:02 PM 
To: Allison Reddington; Peggy Siegal 
Cc: 'Magna Aviation: Sales/Operations' 
Subject: RE: 04AUG12 Dalaman-Kos, pax 1 & Car with Driver in Kos// CHARTER AGREEMENT 

Dear Allison 

Thanks for sending back the Charter Agreement that is well received. 

Kindly make sure to communicate to Leslie/Jeffrey, that as soon as the bank transfer is made, to send us a copy 
of the swift payment. 

We urgently require this, in order to update our accounts accordingly and make sure that payment is in place. 

We look forward to your kind reply. 
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Best regards 

Miltos Mouzakis 

Managing Partner 
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