
From: "Miltos Mouzakis" 

To: "'Allison Reddington"'  

Cc: 

Subject: RE: Turkey to Patmos 

Date: Mon, 30 Jul 2012 14:56:42 +0000 
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Dear Allison 

I am pleased to book & confirm the following charters: 

King Air 200 (twin-engine turboprop) 

04Aug Dalaman-Mykonos ETD 1100 LOCAL (flight time 55mins) 

Rate: EUR 5600 (all incl) (=approx. USD 7018) 

And we also confirm 

Robinson R44 (single helicopter) 

04Aug12 Mykonos-Patmos ETD — 1200-1215 LOCAL (to arrive 12:35-12:50 LOCAL at Patmos) 

Rate: EUR 1800 (all incl) (= approx. USD 2256) 

Please advise how we proceed with payment. All credit cards are welcome as follows; 

VISA/MasterCard (subject to 2,5% service fee) 

AMEX (subject to 3,5% service fee) 

But you can avoid the service fees of Credit Card in case you pay by wire transfer (SWIFT) as follows: 

ALPHA BANK: 

BENEFICIARY: MAGNA TRAVEL 

ACCOUNT NUMBER: 

EFTA00407647



IBAN OF ACCOUNT: 

BRANCH : 0359 ALPHA BANK PSYCHIKOU - KOLLEGIO 

BIC / SWIFT CODE 

Kindly let us know how we proceed. 

Best regards 

Miltos Mouzakis 

Managing Partner 

Mobile 

giDescription: 
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C2F57.68B4EE90 

Ma Travel Ltd 39 Ithomis St. I Glyfada I GR 16561 
Te Fax: +30.210.960.2565 I 

Email: 

Member of 

®,Des 
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Baltic Air Charter Association 

AND 

From: Allison Reddington [mailto 
Sent: &euTSo. 30 IouAiou 2012 17:36 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: FW: Turkey to Patmos 

Hi Richard, 

Hope you enjoyed your weekend! 
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Peggy and Jeffrey spoke and as of now, Jeffrey will be paying for the twin engine from Dalaman to Mykonos 
and Peggy will being paying for the chopper to Patmos. 

It is still up in the air what will happen on Friday, August 10th. 

I have cc'd Milton from Magna Aviation and have attached the credit card payment form for you. 

Please let me know if you require any further assistance. 

Thank you and I look forward to hearing back from you. 

Best, 

Allison 

From: Peggy Siegal 
Sent: Friday, July 27, 2012 4:00 PM 
To: JEEVACATION@GMAIL.COM 
Cc: Allison Reddington; Peggy Siegal; 
Subject: FW: Turkey to Patmos 

; Richard Kahn 

Dear Jeffrey, 

Here is the break down on the three flights that I would like for Turkey and Greece. 

My contact from the company is Miltos Mouzakis of Magna Aviatio miltosOmagna-
aviation.com). 

The total cost in US dollars is around $12,721. Please let me know if this is okay and thank you again. 

xoxo, 

Peggy 
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4800E (Caravan for 04Aug Dalaman to Mykonos, flight time 1 hour), USD 6016 

2250E (Bell 407 for 04Aug Mykonos to Patmos, flight time 26mins), USD 2820 

3100E (Robinson R44 for 10Aug Patmos to Athens, flight time lh 30mins), USD 3885 

Total Cost: 4800+2250+3100 = EUR 10150 (all incl) / or 6016$+2820$+3885$= USD 12'721 

As discussed we can accept USD, but only the above amount, as this is the rate our bank will convert is back to 
Euro. 
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