From: [N NN
To: Richard Kahn H—
Ce: [N I - . 5112 Klcin <[

Subject: Re: Scott
Date: Mon, 30 Jul 2012 21:08:59 +0000

You bet. My printer at 71st and bella's old printer both up and working. The 1ssue with my printer took all of 5
minutes. My address book 1s another matter. He was able to reduce my 30,000 entries to about 19,000 but there
is till work to be done. He is to come this wed and work on it again however. I will ask him to make it speedy

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 30, 2012, at 4:53 PM, Richard Kahn *_* wrote:

I just reviewed and paid Scott's bills which 1 thought were extremely high

Can you please hold him accountable for his work - for example 1 know he keeps working on your
address book and printer

We need to pay him for a solution not to continuously work on same issues..

PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH MY CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS FOLLOWS:

Richard Kahn
HERK. Associates Inc.

tel
fax
cell

EFTA00407716



