From: Lesley Groff <[

To: Sol Krawezyk <[ NG
Subject: Re: HI

Date: Wed, 11 Jul 2012 14:52:04 +0000

Sol, can you tell me if there is a cancellation fee involved (I think Patty said no)...also, what is our anniversary
date of contract so [ can tell our accounting dept. if they ask me.

thanks, Lesley

On Jul 11, 2012, at 10:32 AM, Sol Krawczyk wrote:

Sof Hamweezgh
General Manager

Advanced Imaging Systems

Riverhead, NY | NG
westbury, NY [N
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