
From: 

To: fl > 
Subject: Re: Wire 

Date: Mon, 25 Jun 2012 14:12:58 +0000 

Hi 

Ok great thanks. Rich sent me a wire for expenses but the June 15th wire is for my own 
payment. The amount is: $4000. 

Thanks again, 

On Jun 25, 2012, at 9:26 AM, > wrote: 

> Hi ...not sure. Rich is in today and I have passed this along to him... 
> On Jun 23, 2012, at 12:32 PM, wrote: 

» Hi 
>> 
>> Just checking if Rich was able to send the June 15th wire? 
>> 
>> Thank you! 
>> 
>> 
>> 
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