
From: Lesley Groff -MINIII > 
To: Darren Indyke

Subject: Re: Hotels for PR/STT 
Date: Fri, 22 Jun 2012 14:56:15 +0000 

done...will send confirm once i receive. 
On Jun 22, 2012, at 10:42 AM, Darren Indyke wrote: 

> 5:30 
> 
> Sent from my iPhone 
> 
> On Jun 22, 2012, at 10:39 AM, Lesley Groff ‹ > wrote: 
> 
>> I have booked you at the Verdanza Hotel for Sat. June 24th, which is one mile from the 
airport in San Juan. They do not have a shuttle. You will need to take a cab. Cancellation 
is 3pm day of. $215 total. As soon as I receive the confirm I will forward to you. 
>> 
>> You are booked at The Ritz still in a 2 Bedroom for the nights of the 24th and 25th (out 
on Tues. 26th). I will send you the confirm once I receive. $210.60 Total each night. 
>> 
>> What time would you like to be picked up from your house on Sat. night? Flight departs 
Newark 7:25pm 
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