From: Lesley Groff q~_f*
To: "Lam, Cristina" i_*
Subject: Re: Order #8478174 SO (SLK Designs, LLC) - notice & estimate
Date: Tue, 05 Jun 2012 15:37:33 +0000

Thanks Christina

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 5, 2012, at 11:28 AM, "Lam, Cristina" —':' wrote:

Hi Darren/Lesley,

The proposed publication notice is attached. The publication processes will take 2-3 months.

Please provide the principal business address if the LLC has one.

Please note; prepayment is required for this request. We await your authorization to publish.

Best regards,

Cristina Lam

Senior Customer Specialist

CT Corporation| Wolters Kluwer Corporate Legal Services

111 Eighth Avenue | 13" Floor| New York, NY 10011 ]|

Direct Dial: (212) 894-8668 | Fax: (212) 590-9076 |

Email: Cristina | am@WoltersKluwer.com | www.ctadvantage.com

NY Team 3 Hours: 8:30 - 6:00 pm ET | Team Phone: (212) 590-9332 | Fax: (212) 590-9076

Team Email: NYTeam3@Wolters Kluwer.com

**Please note our new Team Email: NYTeam3@Wolters Kluwer.com™
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CT Corporation supports green initiatives. Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE -The information contained in this transmission is intended only for the person or entity fo
which it is addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. If you are not the intended recipient of this
information, do not review, retransmit, disclose, disseminate, use, or take any action in reliance upon, this information. If
you received this transmission in error, please contact the sender and destroy all printed copies and delete the material
from all computers.
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