From: Darren Indyke *i-
To: Lesley Groff <|| N -

Subject: Re: Privileged and Confidential
Date: Wed, 30 May 2012 13:46:03 +0000

Expedite

Sent from my iPhone

on May 30, 2012, at 9:35 aM, Lesley Groff <[ NG :c:-:

> do you wish to expedite for £530 and you would receive Friday June lst OR just file regular
a

at no extra cost but takes 4-6 we
decide then.
-

i
eks to receive. Zhe will send us

> On May 2%, 2012, at &6:Z8 PM, Darren Indyke wrote:
e

a quote

first and you can

»» Please give the attached to CT Corp and have them file it. Use Darren K. Indyke, PLLC

credit card to pay for any charges if they reguire it in advance.
e

e

»» Darren E. Indyke

»» Darren K. Indyke, PLLC

»> 301 East a6th Street, 1

»>> New York, Hew York 10065

-

»»> Fax: (212) 517-7773

=

»» <8igned Articles of Organization.pdf>
=

Thanks.
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-

»> The information contained in this communication is confidential,

»» or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.

»» communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e

»» communication and all copies therecf, including all attachments.
»» Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - & 2011 Darren E.

#» Indyke, PLLC - All rights reserved.

S

may be attorney-client
»» privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It 1= the property of
»» Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication

If you hawve received this

-mail,

and destroy this
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