
From: Allison Reddington < 
To: "Lesley Groff

Subject: FW: Peggy Siegal RSVP 
Date: Tue, 15 May 2012 15:51:07 +0000 

11

Ili Lesley, 

Thanks again for all of your help dealing with Peggy's Cannes ticket. 

Please advise on the below email regarding the wire transfer. 

Thanks 

Allison 

From: Haiti RSVP [malito 
Sent: Tuesday, May 15, 2012 11:50 AM 
To: Allison Reddington 
Subject: Re: Peggy Siegal RSVP 

Allison, 

That's great, thank you. You don't by chance have a completed registration form to go with the wire transfer 
either from Jeffery's office or yours? 

Thanks, 

Alexandra Krantz 
V Productions 
Email: 
Office: 
Fax: 
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On May 15, 2012, at 3:20 PM, Allison Reddington wrote: 

Hi Alexandra, 

I spoke to Jeffrey's assistant and the money will be wired today. 

Thanks, 

Allison 

From: Haiti RSVP [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, May 14, 2012 11:55 AM 
To: Allison Reddington 
Subject: Re: Peggy Siegal RSVP 

Hi Allison, 

The party begins at 9:30pm on the 18th, tomorrow you will be getting an email with detailed information about 
the event, ie directions and what to do upon arrival. Once we receive your payment I will send you a 
confirmation email that it has been processed. 

Please let me know if you or Ms. Siegal have any more questions. 

Best, 

Alexandra Krantz 
V Productions 
Email: 
Office: 
Fax: 

On May 14, 2012, at 4:45 PM, Allison Reddington wrote: 
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Hello, 

I would like to RSVP Peggy Siegal for the Haiti dinner Friday, the 18th at 9:30pm. 

Peggy has spoken to Sara Weinstein and payment will be made today. 

Please let me know the timing of the event and the address of the Agora Pavilion. 

Thank you in advance for all of your help and I look forward to hearing back from you. 

Best, 

Allison Reddington 

Assistant to Peggy Siegal 

Peggy Siegal Company 

750 Lexington Avenue 

Sth Floor 

New York, NY 10022 
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