From: Darren Indyke < _
To: Lesley Groff <[ -

Subject: Fwd: LS] Pool Agreement
Date: Tue, 01 May 2012 14:54:04 +0000
Attachments: L5J Pool Agreement.pdf

Please print attachment. Thanks.

Darren K. Indyke

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC
301 East 66th Street, 10B
New York, New York 10065
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - ® 2011 Darren K.

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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Begin forwarded message:

From: brice gordon _}
Date: February 14, 2012 10:45:50 AM EST
To: Rich Kahn < =
Cc: Darren Indyke =
Subject: Fwd: LSJ Pool Agreement

as requested, you will find payment schedule as part of agreement

--mmmmmm-- Forwarded message ----------
From: BMG <
Date: Tue, Jan 17, 2012 at 5:53 PM
Subject: Fwd: LSJ] Pool Agreement
To: Darren Indyke <
Ce¢: Richard Kahn <

<lsjasland(@ gmail.com™>
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Hope this works
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Monique Harry <
Date: January 17, 2012 4:32:29 PM GMT-04:00

To: Brice Gordon <[

Subject: LSJ Pool Agreement

Per your request.

MONIQUE HARRY
Project Administrator
LSJT, LLC

6100 Red Hook Qtr Suite A2-7
5t. Thomas, USVI 00802

Telephone
Fa

Brice Gordon
Little Saint James

USVI
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