
From: Lesley Groff 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Thu, 19 Apr 2012 14:40:37 +0000 

cavity: $375. I will give her the price of all 

On Apr 19, 2012, at 10:36 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

ok 

On Thu, Apr 19, 2012 at 10:10 AM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
Do you approve xrays for tomorrow for $175? I want to let her know she can go for her cleaning, 
give her the price and tell her she must ask first next time...but I would like to know if she is allowed to have 
xrays as well before I call her... 
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