
From: 
To: Melanie Spinella 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Mon, 16 Apr 2012 17:30:08 +0000 

oh wow! Ok, thanks... 
also, Jeffrey has not responded to the 6-6:30 question for Leon to stop by today...did they speak about this 
perchance? 

On Apr 16, 2012, at 1:25 PM, Melanie Spinella wrote: 

Hi Lesley — Leon and Jeffrey spoke and Jeffrey is writing a check to MELANOMA RESEARCH ALLIANCE for $1.5 million. 

Leon said he would like to check by May 1st. I think Jeffrey asked Leon to let you know! Thanks 

Melanie Spinella 
Assistant to Leon D. Black 

ent, LP 
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