
From: Lesley Groff <MIMIlle 
To: cimin 

Subject: Re: Amex 
Date: Thu, 15 Mar 2012 18:53:22 +0000 

ok great. thanks 
On Mar 15, 2012, at 2:49 PM, wrote: 

> Yes, I spoke to them, it was for a satphone credit payment, all is good thx,. 
> Still trying to get GII up running, however the boeing is good, thx 

 Original Message 
> • From: Lesley Groff 
> To: Larry 
> Subject: Amex 
> Sent: Mar 15, 2012 2:47 PM 

> • LARRY, an automated call from Amex came to the office line number asking for you or Jeffrey 
re a charge or something..I think you should call Amex just in case to see if there is 
something to this...call the number on the back of your Amex card... 
> Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 
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