
From: Cecile de Jongh < 
To: Lesley Groff

Subject: Re: Tribeca ball donation 
Date: Fri, 09 Mar 2012 16:01:14 +0000 

Good luck!!! I am sure you will track the info down. 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 9, 2012, at 11:58 AM, Lesley Groff > wrote: 

i know...that is crazy...i've been on the website and figured it out...but you would think they would put it on 
their rsvp....??! the address of where the event is to take place is not there either!? I have put a call in to them 
just to make sure I have it all down correctly. 

April 16th: 6pm cocktails, 8:30 dinner at III Franklin Street (I think!) 

On Mar 9, 2012, at 10:55 AM, Cecile de Jongh wrote: 

Thanks. I did not see a time but I guess you can call them. 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 9, 2012, at 11:09 AM, Lesley Groff <Ma wrote: 

thank you Cecile! I will put in Jeffrey's calendar! 

On Mar 8, 2012, at 5:41 PM, Cecile de Jongh wrote: 

Lesley, 

JE would like you to put this event on his calendar. Thanks. 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

Sent from my iPhone 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: si 
Date: March 8, 2012 5:26:45 PM GMT-04:00 
To: "'Richard Kahn"     "'Darren Indyke < 
Cc: "'Cecile de JongIr 
Subject: Tribeca ball donation 

Rich 

JEE just authorized the attached $25,000 for the tribeca ball from JEVIF. We have cut the check in STT and will 
send tomorrow with the backup/invitation. DKI is only signatory on this account. 

JEVIF needs funding current first bank balance 7K. Una is forwarding a request for funding under separate email. 

Jeanne 
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