From: Darren Indyke <[ N
To: Lesley Groff <[

Subject: Fwd: deposit confirmation-N162AD
Date: Mon, 09 Jan 2012 18:08:56 +0000
Attachments: N162AD-dep confpdf

Please print. Thanks.

Darren K. Indyke

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC
301 East 66th Street, 10B
New York, New York 10065
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - ® 2011 Darren K.

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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Begin forwarded message:

From: Katie Miler <} GG
Date: January 9, 2012 12:58:42 PM EST

To: Darren Indyke <[ -

Subject: deposit confirmation-N162AD

Hello,

The attached letter will confirm funds into escrow on the above referenced airerafi.
Please let me know if our office can be of further assistance or if you have any gquestions.
Best Regards,

Katie Miller

for Joan F. Roberts, Vice President

Insured Aircraft Title Service
4848 SW 36
Oklahoma City, OK 73179
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