
From: ' 

To:' 

Subject: Re: my next appointment with Dr.Victor 

Date: Wed, 28 Dec 2011 15:54:26 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

Dear 

I'll contact you on 4th Jan. But if Jeff will be back before that time, please let me know. 
I think it will be my last 5 month of treatment. If doctor will not tell me to do 6 as well. 

Thank you again and have a good day! 

Sent on the Sprint® Now Network from my BlackBerry® 

From: 
Date: Tue, 27 Dec 2011 15:47:49 -0500 
To:
Subject: Re: my next appointment with Dr.Victor 

I am afraid Jeffrey will not be back until January 4th... 

On Dec 27, 2011, at 12:54 PM, < 

HI dear IM 

> < > wrote: 

I hope you had a great time with your family during the Christmas time and I hope you enjoyed your trip 
to Florida. 
I need your help again. Because on 28th Wed Dec I have my appointment with Dr. Victor for my accutane 
programme. 
I don't know if you remember I am on 60mg. I need to buy 40mg+20mg , it's about 262$+348$. so, it's 
about 680$ or 700$ with taxes. 
Last time Jeffery gave me 600$. If he can help me with the same ammount this time. I'll be very happy. 
I know it's a Holidays and it's will be very hard to reach people but it's how Dr. Victor arranged this 
appointment for me based on my records in a system for Ipledge programme. 
I hope Bella's office is open Wed. I know a lot of people are working on Wed. 

Please, let me know as soon as you'll have any news for me. 

Thank you so much in advance for everything. 

Happy New Year—

EFTA00422394


