
From: 
To: Rich Kahn 

Subject: Fwd: 57,000 donation from Jeffrey Epstein for Gotham Awards- IFP 
Date: Tue, 22 Nov 2011 16:10:55 +0000 

Attachments: 2011 Jeffrey_Epstein_Donation_-_Gothain Awards.pdf; IFP_Gothams_Invoice _-
Jeff—rey_Epstein.pdf 

do you have this? 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Steven Pfeiffer 
Date: November 21, 2011 11:50:35 AM EST 
To: 
Cc: Joana Vicente < >, Andrew Houchens H 
Subject: RE: $7,000 donation from Jeffrey Epstein for Gotham Awards- IFP 

Hello 

Many thanks for confirming the details for Mr. Epstein's contribution. I have included your contribution letter and 
invoice here. These contain details on the organization, as well as to indicate our 501c3 status. Please review, and please 
do not hesitate to follow back up with me, should you have any questions or additional needs. 

Many thank once again! 

Best, 
Steven 

From: [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, November 21, 2011 11:27 AM 
To: Steven Pfeiffer 
Subject: Re: $7,000 donation from Jeffrey Epstein for Gotham Awards- IFP 

you may use the below address for the paperwork: 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10B 
NY, NY 10065 

thanks 
On Nov 21, 2011, at 10:51 AM, Steven Pfeiffer wrote: 

Sounds great, thanks. I have the letter mocked up, so I can send along to you when you do. Thanks! 

From: [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, November 21, 2011 10:49 AM 
To: Steven Pfeiffer 
Subject: Re: $7,000 donation from Jeffrey Epstein for Gotham Awards- IFP 
Importance: High 

EFTA00423098



thank you for this...I will find out what mailing address you should include and get back to you. 
On Nov 21, 2011, at 10:46 AM, Steven Pfeiffer wrote: 

Hello Leslie — 

We would like to thank Jeffrey for his generous donation to IFP and the Gotham Awards this year, in the amount of 
$7,000. I will send along the donation letter and invoice this morning, so you will have all of the necessary items on your 
end. 

If you could simply provide to me the mailing address I am to include on these materials, and any information you may 
need from me, that would be greatly helpful. Please note: These forms will be sent to you via email, the mailing address 
information is simply to be included on this paperwork. 

many thanks, 
Steven 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: November 19, 2011 5:20:36 PM EST 
To: Peggy Siegal < 
Cc: Joana Vicente <jvicente@ifp.org>. "< 
Subject: Re: $7,000 donation from Jeffrey Epstein for Gotham Awards- IFP 

Hi peggy. I have been in the loop on the donation. Steve is supposed to be following up with me I believe. I 
mentioned it to Jeffrey as well. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 19, 2011, at 4:15 PM, "Peggy Siegal"

Joane: Did you speak to his office...ie. his assistant and organize the donation? 

When can we talk about the chair rentals and table tops...and using our orchards too.. 
Peg 

Joana Vicente 
Executive Director. IFP 

www.ifp.org

> wrote: 
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