
From: Lesley Groff 
To: Darren Indyke

Subject: Re: $7,000 donation from Jeffrey Epstein for Gotham Awards- IFP 
Date: Mon, 21 Nov 2011 15:56:02 +0000 

ok 
On Nov 21, 2011, at 10:50 AM, Darren Indyke wrote: 

Probably mine, but ask JE. 

Darren K. Indyke 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC 

email: 

************ ************************* * ***** ** ******* ************************************ ****** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC —All rights reserved. 
********************************************* ******* ** ****** ***** ******** ********** ************ 

On Nov 21, 2011, at 10:50 AM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

Darren, Steven is asking for a mailing address to include on this paperwork for a donation JE might be 
making. What physical address should I tell him to include? (or do I need to ask jeffrey?) 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Steven Pfeiffer < 
Date: November 21, 2011 10:46:49 AM EST 
To: 
Cc: Joana Vicente <->. Andrew Houchens < 
Subject: RE: $7,000 donation from Jeffrey Epstein for Gotham Awards- IFP 

• < 

Hello Leslie 

EFTA00423501



We would like to thank Jeffrey for his generous donation to IFP and the Gotham Awards this year, in the amount of 
$7,000. I will send along the donation letter and invoice this morning, so you will have all of the necessary items on 
your end. 

If you could simply provide to me the mailing address I am to include on these materials, and any information you 
may need from me, that would be greatly helpful. Please note: These forms will be sent to you via email, the mailing 
address information is simply to be included on this paperwork. 

many thanks, 
Steven 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Lesley Groff < 
Date: November 19, 2011 5:20:36 PM EST 
To: Peggy Siegal < 
Cc: Joana Vicente < >, ' 
Subject: Re: $7,000 donation from Jeffrey Epstein for Gotham Awards- IFP 

Hi peggy. I have been in the loop on the donation. Steve is supposed to be following up with me I believe. I 
mentioned it to Jeffrey as well. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 19, 2011, at 4:15 PM, "Peggy Siegal"

Joane: Did you speak to his office...ie. Lesley, his assistant and organize the donation? 

When can we talk about the chair rentals and table tops...and using our orchards too.. 
Peg 

Joana Vicente 
Executive Director, IFP 

www.ifp.org

> wrote: 
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