From: Darren Indyke *-'-'_-‘-*
To: [
Subject: Fwd: 9 East T1st Invoice
Date: Mon, 07 Nov 2011 17:24:42 +0000
Attachments: 9 East 7lst.pdf
Inline-Images: image001 . jpg

Please print the attached right now. Thanks.

Darren K. Indyke
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - ® 2011 Darren K.

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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Begin forwarded message:

From: Richard Kahn _:-
Date: October 11, 2011 9:27:18 AM EDT

To: Darren Indyke < =

Subject: Fwd: 9 East 71st Invoice

Richard Kahn

From: "Perez, Elizabeth T." f-—}

EFTA00424546



Date: October 10, 2011 9:30:26 AM EDT

To: = < =

Cc: < > < > < >
Subject: 9 East 71st Invoice

Good Marning,

Can you please check the status of the attached invoice and let me know when we could expect payment.

Thanks,

Elizabeth Perez (NN

Office Assistant

Confidentiality Note: This e-mail message and any attachments to it are intended only for the named recipients and may
contain legally privileged and/or confidential information.

If you are not one of the intended recipients, please do not duplicate or forward this e-mail message and immediately
delete it from your computer.

SourceOne, Inc. | 132 Canal Street | Boston, MA 02114 | [ GGG

EFTA00424547



