
From: Lesley Groff <Ma> 
To: Scott Denett 

Subject: Re: monday @ 71st 

Date: Sun, 23 Oct 2011 21:07:48 +0000 

Ok sounds good to me. Keep in touch with sue and confirm time with her. We will make sure to 
get you paid tomorrow :) 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 23, 2011, at 4:57 PM, Scott Denett •,: > wrote: 

> Hi Lesley 

> So JE has some work for me to do. 

> -set up 4th floor gym Apple TV ( network, music and video streaming ) 

> -Help Sue Switch to iPhone 4S 

> • Also he mentioned getting into ical. 

> • I could not complete this work today as Sue had some issues getting the phone at Apple and 
forgot the Apple TV. 

> So POINT IS: 

> • 10am mon is too early to give Sue a 2nd chance to go to Apple and get what we need to Do 
what JE wants done. 

> So instead I think 1-2pm will prob work out better. 

> • I spent extra time tuning your system today as well and it felt speedy again. 

> Calendar was still working. 

> Contacts are there, but the greater issue of syncing back and forth and removing duplicates 
still remains for us to solve. 

> • I am waiting to here back from Sue on a good start time but I think 1-2pm will be best. 

> • Also I have yet to get paid for these last 2 visits JUST an FYI not a major concern but I 
will need to get paid monday. The standing total is $500.00 

> • Thank You, 

> Scott 
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