From: Bella Klein <] -
To: Lesley Groff </ -

Subject: Re: Scott Denett
Date: Mon, 24 Oct 2011 16:30:46 +0000

[eda) T06-7223
On Oet 24, 2011, at 12:29% PM, Lesley Groff wrote:

> what is your efax number? 1 just sent it to Rich's fax

-
> on Oct 24, 2011, at 1z2:27 EBFM, Bella Klelin wrote:
=3

»» thank you. PFlease fax the inwvoice to my efax
B> LHE
>» On Oct 24, 2011, at 1Z2:26 PM, Lesley Groff wrote:

=
#»» Jjust faxed you Scott's involice for Friday and Sunday. It is for SE.IIIIZI.-ga'-.n: me the
700..80 1 will giwve him $600 now and we will see what today holds.

e
e
2> On Oct 24, 2011, at 9:41 AM, Richard Kahn wrote:
e

»»>»> 1 think regardless of how he iz paid we szhould receive invoices
»»>»>» lesley please let us know if jee needs cash as well

»»>>» thanks

e e

»»»>» Richard Kahn

»»»> HBRE Associates Inc.

=2»>> 301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F

»2a> New d Y JO0es
2> tel
»»>»> fax

x> cel
e
2rxx» On Oct 24, 2011, at 9:36 AM, Lesley Groff wrote:
i

»rx>> Scott came to the house Friday and Sunday...he is coming again today and needs to be
paid...we owe him 5500 so far. Jeffrey ok'd cash for him when he comesz. May we get £500
plus over to the house today to pay him? I don't knoew how much today will be. I can get him
to email me or bring me an involice 1f you like. Maybe Jena can bring to the house?

B

»rrrr Let me know.
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