
From: Bella Klein
To: 

Subject: Re: about my peels CLARAVIS 

Date: Tue, 27 Sep 2011 13:39:02 +0000 

ok 
On Sep 27, 2011, at 9:38 AM, wrote: 

Please give Polina $3501 She will come today. trying to find out around what time! 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein < 
Date: Se tember 27, 2011 9:36:47 AM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Re: about my peels CLARAVIS 

Yes 

On Tue, Sep 27, 2011 at 3:24 PM, 
shall we give her $350 again? (she is very thankful :) 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: Se tember 27. 2011 8:43:17 AM EDT 
To: ' > 
Subject: Re: about m eels CLARAVIS 
Reply-To: 

> wrote: 

Yes, honey. I can!!! Thank you so muchmn 
I am not sure how much is the 40mg. I can tell you only how much it cost only after I'll get the peels;) 
Last time he gave me for peels 350. I think something around this amount will be more than enough. And 
I'll figure out if I need more later or not but I think it's shouldn't be a huge difference in price between 
20mg and 40mg. 

Let me know if it's ok. Thank you so much!! And yes, I can go to Bella office today. :) 

Please tell to Jeffery he makes me so happy and I miss him!!! 

Sent on the Sprint® Now Network from my BlackBeny® 

From: 
Date: Tue, 27 Sep 2011 07:32:51 -0400 
To:  
Subject: Re: about my peels CLARAVIS 
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Polina! Jeffrey will pay. Do you know how much it is? Can you come to see Bella in the office today? If 
so what time? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 27, 2011, at 1:16 AM, < > wrote: 

Dear IM 

I visited yesterday Victor's office and they checked my face at the same time of my hair removal 
procedure. 
They just found out (and I agree with that) that 20mg doesn't much help me and specially for my 
back Victor's said that I have to use the one left package which I have as a two capsules per day( 
40mg totally). And it means I'll finished this period of month a little bit earlier. So, since I have only 
8 capsules it's only for 4 more days. 
Angela gave me already the new prescription for 40mg and she said I need to get the peels by Thu. 
I was wondering if you can ask Jeffery to help me with buying peels for the next month. Could you 
ask him please? I'll be happy if can help me before Thu. I don't want to brake my treatment. 

Laughing
Hope to hear from you soon and thank you in advance. 

—Polina—
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