
From: 
To: Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: check for 
Date: Wed, 21 Sep 2011 17:05:14 +0000 

great thx... and no JE has not answered me on quite a few things...but i have you on my Iist...JE has a 10am with 
Larry Newman and a lunch at 12:30, so maybe after that 
On Sep 21, 2011, at 1:00 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

just gave her check and cash 
do you have a time yet for tomorrow - preferably afternoon.. 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Sep 21, 2011, at 12:14 PM, wrote: 

Make check to Pacific College of Oriental Medicine. $7072.00 

On Sep 21, 2011, at 11:50 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

never came by for money yesterday.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Sep 21, 2011, at 10:32 AM, wrote: 

I have emailed Harry and called his cell...when he walks in could one of you please ask Harry to call JE... 

thanks! 
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