From: Darren Indyke *i'_‘-*
To: I -
Subject: Fwd: . and . v. J.E. Settlement Documents
Date: Wed, 10 Aug 2011 22:45:05 +0000
Attachments: CO_SettlementDocs.pdf; DK SettlementDocs.pdf
Inline-Images: image006.jpg; image007.png: image001.jpg

Please print the attachments.

Darren K. Indyke

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC
301 East 66th Street, 10B
New York, New York 10065
Telephone:

Direct:

Fax: (212) 517-7779
email:
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - ® 2011 Darren K.

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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Begin forwarded message:

From: "Esther E. Galicia" < =

Date: August 10, 2011 4:54.28 PM EDT

To: Darren Indyke >

Cc: "CHRISTOPHER E. KNIGHT" < >, "Lisa B. Toney" <LToney@fowler-
=, Olga Bencomo < =

Subject: FW: . and . v. J.E. Settlement Documents

Good Afternoon Darren,

Attached are copies of the above-referenced settlement documents which
have been executed by the Claimants. Our anticipated receipt of the Originals,
either tomorrow or Friday, triggers the 5-day period to wire transfer the
settlement funds to Mr. Edwards’ firm’s trust account. Do you already have the

account information to consummate the wire transfer or do we need to get that
from Mr. Kdwards?
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I will immediately advise you of our receipt of the Originals and Federal
Express the Originals to you so that My. Epstein can execute them. Not sure who
will be keeping the fully executed copies but I will, at the very least, need you to

send me fully executed copies so I can forward them to Mr. Edwards.

Esther

Esther E. Galicia

SHAREHOLDER
vCard | Biography | Website

main
direct

305.728.7544 fax

From: Maria Kelljchian [mailto:

Espirito Santo Plaza
1395 Brickell Avenue

14" Floor
Miami, Florida 33131

www.fowler-white.com

Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2011 4:34 PM

To: Esther E. Galicia
Cc: Brad Edwards

Subject: . and . v. 1.E. Settlement Documents

Esther: Attached please find the scanned ORIGINAL documents which are being mailed to you today.

Please let me know when you receive the originals, you should receive them by tomorrow or Friday. If you
prefer, | can have them hand-delivered to your Fort Lauderdale office_.if so, let me know immediately as the

mail leaves at 5pm.

Thank you,
Maria

Maria W. Kelljchian
Florida Registered Paralegal
Farmer, Jaffe, Weissing,
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Edwards, Fistos & Lehrman, P.L.
425 Morth Andrews Avenue, Suite 2
Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33301

954-524-2821 fax

=

=

Become our fan on Facebook

**TAX MATTERS- IRS Circular 230 Disclosure: To ensure compliance with requirements imposed by
the IRS, we inform you that any tax advice contained in this communication (including attachments)
was not intended or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the purpose of (i) avoiding penalties
under the Internal Revenue Code or (i) promoting, marketing or recommending to another party any
transaction or matter addressed herein. If you would like such advice, please contact us.***
***Attention: The information contained in this E-mail message is attorney privileged and confidential
information intended only for the use of the individual(s) named above. If the reader of this message
is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copy of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please
contact the sender by reply E-mail and destroy all copies of the ariginal message. Thank you.
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