
From: Zorro Development <zorro.office®gmail.com> 
To: Zorro Ranch <zorro.office®gmail.com> 
Cc: Darren Ind ke , Richard Kahn < 

Subject: Re: ZD-Discharge-Permit-Renewal-6-7-11 
Date: Wed, 22 Jun 2011 16:37:46 +0000 

>, Lesley Groff 

Good afternoon Rich 
You e mailed today that you have not received invoice please note E Mail I sent to all parties 6/20/11 

"tanks 

6100 Red Hook Quarters B3 
St Thomas 
Ua m

On Jun 20, 23 Heisei, at 1:16 PM, Zorro Ranch <zorro.office@gmail.com> wrote: 

Good Afternoon, 
FYI - Zorm Check #8701 for $3,450.00 was mailed out today for payment of PRD 20090001, 341 - Discharge 
Fee 
I have informed Steve Pedro of the Ground Water Quality Bureau that he should receive the check by 6/24/11 
If there are any questions or concerns please E Mail 
Wannest regards 
Kam: 

On Tue, Jun 7, 2011 at 5:23 PM, Darren Indyke c > wrote: 
Great. Send invoice as soon as you get it because payment of the fee must be received by New Mexico 
Environment Department within 30 days of the date the permit is issued, which based on the attachment you 
sent us appears to be May 31, 2011. By my count, that means that the payment must be received by NMED 
not later than June 30, 2011. Rich please set this on your calendar and coordinate with Ranch personnel to 
make sure that this gets paid timely. Lesley, please put June 30, 2011, as well as June 23 and June 16 as 
reminders about payment of the discharge permit fee. 

Darren K. Indyke 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC 
301 East 66th Street, 10B 
New York, 
Tele 
Dire 
Fax: 
emai : 

********************************************************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attomey-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 
************************************************** ******* tit ****** *************** *************** 

On Jun 7, 2011, at 6:02 PM, Zorro Ranch wrote: 

Good Evening Darien & Rich, 
Attached a copy for your records of Discharge Permit, DP-1452 which has been renewed and will expire 
May 31st 2016. 
Please note them will be an invoice for the Discharge Permit Fee of $3,450.00. 
If there are any questions or concerns please E Mail 
Warmest regards 

Z0170 Development Corp 
49 Z0170 Ranch Road 
Stanley, NM 87056 

Ray 
Tel 

CD-Discharge-Permit-Renewal-6-7-11.pdf> 

Z017'0 Development Corp 
49 Z017'0 Ranch Road 
Stanley, NM 87056 

Rat 
Tel: 

zorro.office(iegmail.com 
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