
From: Bella Klein •t: > 
To: Lesley Groff

Subject: Re 
Date: Thu, 09 Jun 2011 17:45:30 +0000 

Attachments: 12-30 

On Jun 9, 2011, at 1:34 PM, wrote: 

is asking if i can find an email where JE states he will help her pay for her 
rent... I can't find it...but I do recall this conversation...however, I do not recall the 
amount he said he would pay. 

> possibly you have an email on this? I may have been texting with I am not sure... 

> Les 
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