From: Darren Indyke <} -

To: W Richard Kahn < . I

Subject: Re: ZD-Discharge-Permit-Renewal-6-7-11
Date: Tue, 07 Jun 2011 22:23:01 +0000

Great. Send invoice as soon as you get it because payment of the fee must be received by New Mexico
Environment Department within 30 days of the date the permit is 1ssued, which based on the attachment you sent
us appears to be May 31, 2011. By my count, that means that the payment must be received by NMED not later
than June 30, 2011. Rich please set this on your calendar and coordinate with Ranch personnel to make sure that
this gets paid timely. please put June 30, 2011, as well as June 23 and June 16 as reminders about
payment of the discharge permit fee.

Darren K. Indyke

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC
301 East 66th Street, 10B
New York, New York 10065
Telephone: (212) 517-2052
Direct: (646) 862-4817

Fax: (212) 517-7779
email:
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - @ 2011 Darren K.

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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On Jun 7, 2011, at 6:02 PM, Zorro Ranch wrote:

Good Evening Darren & Rich,

Attached a copy for vour records of Discharge Permit, DP-1452 which has been renewed and will expire May
35t 2016

Please note there will be an invaoice for the Discharge Permit Fee of 83,450.00.

If there are any questions or concerns please E Mail

Warmest regards

Karen

Zorro Development Corp
49 Zorro Ranch Road
Stanley, NM 87056

EFTA00432969



Ranch Manager
Tel: 505 938 2920
Fax: 505 938 2924
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