
From: 
To: jessica banks

Subject: Re: Payment for transcription service 
Date: Tue, 17 May 2011 14:12:56 +0000 

call me when you can today. 

On May 16, 2011, at 5:01 PM, jessica banks wrote: 

Hey...yeah. That's why I suggested I send you the file. And it doesn't have to be overnight (the most 
expensive). In fact, we could go with the least expensive. The file is very large however so I would have to 
send it to you through yousendit.com 
Let's discuss this tomorrow morn? (at work now and hustling on a deadline). 

On Mon, May 16, 2011 at 3:55 PM, > wrote: 
Hey Jessica...I went to this web site...what service will you use? 1 am not really sure how i am to pay for 
you with a CC?? It looks like you need to go in and input some data...then at the end of your order you put in 
the CC#? I'm not sure... 

On May 15, 2011, at 11:42 PM, jessica banks wrote: 

Great! Just let me know and I'll jump in and up and around. 

Talk soon! 

On Fri, May 13, 2011 at 8:36 PM, > wrote: 
hiiiieee :) it has been awhile. Maybe its easiest for me to give a cc # to them...let me double check with 
JE and I will get back to you. Have a glorious weekend. 

On_y_Lri May 13, 2011 at 7:29 PM, jessica banks < > wrote: 

Hope you've been great. I have a question for you....I am supposed to be transcribing that interview for 
JE and need to pay for the service. 
JE said you guys would cover it but I am not sure the best way to go about this. 
This is the place: http://castingwords.com/ 

I don't think it's a total rush since I won't be able to get to it until around the 26th so we def don't need 
the fastest turn around. I could send you the file too....to send to them. 

Though maybe I should give them my credit card and have you reimburse (not totally the preferred but 
definitely an alternative). 

Anyway, let me now what works best and how to move forward and we'll get a start on this long 
overdue project. 

Talk to you soon and sending lovely weekend wishes... 
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