
From: Philippe Barr ..ta. 

To: Lesley Groff <MIMIlle 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

Date: Mon, 18 Apr 2011 16:32:58 +0000 

Let me c when I get to the salon tomorrow and I will let u know. 
Thanks Lesley. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 18, 2011, at 12:23, Lesley Groff "C > wrote: 

> ok perfect. I think we can have III coordinate with you to get you your payment. Would 
you be able to stop by the house tomorrow after work? III, can you help coordinate? 
> 
> 
> On Apr 18, 2011, at 12:16 PM, Philippe Barr wrote: 
> 
>> Sure it was Thursday night there was no ticket so u can pay me. 
» Thanks have a great day ( I am in NYC Tuesday & Thursday ) 
>> Philippe B 
>> 
>> Sent from my iPhone 
>> 
>> On Apr 18, 2011, at 11:23, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
>> 
>>> Hello Phillipe. I would like to make sure the cut you did for Jeffrey last Friday is 
paid for. Do we need to pay you or the salon? 
> 
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