
Frommjeffileyepgehtleevacafion&rnail.ann> 
To: Lesley Groff <Ma 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 05 Apr 2011 20:27:26 +0000 

Pay for half she pays for half , if she completes we reimburse fir her share 

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 5, 2011, at 10:07 AM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

> Just a reminder I still have the paper on school for that she gave me 
(she would like to take photography courses at the School of the International Center of 
Photography. Total is $3280.) 

has not contacted me on this...i just didn't want it to slip through the cracks. 

> the courses start the week of April 11th (next week) 

EFTA00436154


