From: [ -
To: Darren Indyke <[ GG

Subject: Re: Calendar
Date: Thu, 17 Mar 2011 14:01:43 +0000

will do
On Mar 17, 2011, at %:48 AM, Darren Indyke wrote:

> Put in the calendar that Molyneux final payment is due April 4, 2011. EFemind one week
hefore. Thanks.
-

> Darren K. Indyke

» Darren K. Indyke, PLLC

> 301 East &6th Street, 10B
» New York, New York 10065
> Telephone:
> Direct:

> Pax:

> email:
-
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> The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client

> privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

» Darren K. Indyke, PLLZ. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication

> or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this
> communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this

> communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

> Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLZ - @ 2011 Darren K.

> Indyke, PLLC - All rights reserved.
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