
From: 
To: Jefffrey Epstein • , Rich Kahn

Subject: Fwd: IFP Donation for Gotham Awards/Jeffrey Epstein 

Date: Fri, 25 Nov 2016 13:50:04 +0000 

I have received 3 emails in an email chain from Peggy then Steven then the IFP representative....this is the first 
one...I will forward the next 2 to you as well. They are wanting to be paid the $10,000 from last year...they are 
saying it is an "outstanding invoice"...I gave not responded at all... 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Peggy Siegal 
Subject: Re: IFP Donation for Gotham Awards/Jeffrey Epstein 
Date: November 23, 2016 at 5:04:46 PM EST 
To: Steven Pfeiffer Jeffrey Epstein 
Cc: IFP Business Office , Lila Walker 
Drescher , Joana Vicente 

>, Rebecca 

I thought Joana and in Jeffrey's office already took care of the invoice for $10,000 for the ballroom 
chairs for the gala. 

If not, =I Jeffrey's assistant will process it on Monday. 
xoxo Peggy 

Joane....where am I sitting this year. 
You always find a great seat for me. 
Xoxo Peggy. 

Original Message 
From: Steven Pfeiffer 
Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2016 11:45 AM 
To: Peggy Siegal 
Cc: IFP Business Office; Lila Walker; Rebecca Drescher; Joana Vicente 
Subject: IFP Donation for Gotham Awards/Jeffrey Epstein 

Hi Peggy - 

I hope all is well with you. It was brought to my attention that we had not yet sent to you this year's Jeffrey 
Epstein donation invoice. I have issued the new invoice for 2016, which is attached here. 

If you need anything else from us on this, please let us know. Many thanks once again! 

Best, 
Steven 

Steven Pfeiffer 
Associate Director, Development 
Independent Filmmaker Project 
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