
From: 
To: Rich Kahn -4 

Subject: Re: Chairs at the Gotham Awards 
Date: Wed, 23 Nov 2016 16:05:32 +0000 

will do 

On Nov 23, 2016, at 10:44 AM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

i will have bella process check now 
can you let then know it will be ready today and ask them where we shall send 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.conn>
Subject: Re: Chairs at the Gotham Awards 
Date: November 23, 2016 at 10:35:05 AM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < 

yes for this year only 

On Wed, Nov 23, 2016 at 9:12 AM, Richard Kahn < 
please advise if i should send 10k from enhanced 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

wrote: 

Begin forwarded message: 
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From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: Chairs at the Gotham Awards 
Date: November 21, 2016 at 9:34:51 AM EST 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>

we sent 10k last year on 11/23 and they never cashed or received then you said not to reissue 

Attached please find lost check with backup 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: bellaklein < 
Subject: Fwd: Chairs at the Gotham Awards 
Date: March 21, 2016 at 4:03:18 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: Jeanne >, Una Pascal < 

Check will not be reprinted, see below 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Darren Indyke < 
Subject: Re: Chairs at the Gotham Awards 
Date: March 21, 2016 at 3:59:54 PM EDT 
To: bellaklein < 

As per JE, do not resend the check. Just void the old one. 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

>, 
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - O 2016 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC - All rights reserved. 
********* **** ************* ********************************** 

******************************************* 

On Mar 21, 2016, at 3:58 PM, bellaklein

fyi 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Re: Chairs at the Gotham Awards 
Date: March 21, 2016 at 3:21:01 PM EDT 
To: Bella Klein < 

wow...ok... 

wrote: 

On Mar 21, 2016, at 3:18 PM, bellaklein < wrote: 

Mitchell told me they don't follow up on donations.... Jeannie, Please put a stop payment on 
check 2618 with First Bank. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Mar 21, 2016, at 3:12 PM, > wrote: 

I think you are speaking to the proper people re the check...Peggy just helps facilitate Jeffrey's 
donation to the Gotham Awards...I can't believe they never followed up to see where the check 
was!!! But I think If Mitchell knows a new check is being issued, you are all set! 
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On Mar 21, 2016, at 3:09 PM, bellaklein < wrote: 

I just contacted IFP over the phone. Spoke to Mitchell -Deputy director. He confirmed that 
check was not received from Enhanced. I will mail today a replaced check. S should you 
confirm with Peggy first? 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 212-971-1307 

On Mar 21, 2016, at 2:52 PM, 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Re: Chairs at the Gotham Awards 
Date: November 20, 2015 at 5:16:08 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn 

Yes. Let me find 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 20, 2015, at 4:59 PM, Richard Kahn

do you have email with original paperwork from Gotham? 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 

sim
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 'Jeffrey E." 
Subject: Fwd: Chairs at the Gotham Awards 
Date: November 20. 2015 at 4:57:50 PM EST 

wrote: 

> wrote: 
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To: Richard Kahn < 

10k 
Forwarded message 

From: 
Date: Fri, Nov 20, 2015 at 4:47 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Chairs at the Gotham Awards 
To: "jeffrey E." <jesios@gmail.com> 

Please see below and advise... 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Clare Richardson <1 
Subject: Chairs at the Gotham Awards 
Date: November 20, 2015 at 4:45:47 PM EST 
To: '
Cc: Steven Pfeiffer 

Hi En 

Peggy Siegal's office gave me your contact to reach out about the chairs for the Gotham Awards. 
looping in my colleague Steven Pfeiffer who will be able to share payment details. 

Best, 
Clare 

Clare Richardson 
Executive Assistant 
Independent Filmmaker Project 
Made in NY Media Center by IFP 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeeN n@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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