
From: ==. > 
To: Joana Vicente 

Cc: Bella Klein , Rich Kahn IFP Business 
Office <businessoffice@ifp.org> 

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein-Check for Gotham Chairs 
Date: Wed, 23 Nov 2016 16:33:13 +0000 

Please give us the address of where the check should be sent. Thanks 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Nov 23, 2016, at 11:30 AM, Joana Vicente <j wrote: 

> • Thank you ! 

> Sent from my iPhone 

>> On Nov 23, 2016, at 4:10 PM, > wrote: 
> > 
» Hello Joana...the check from Jeffrey Epstein for $10,000 has been written and will be ready 
to send out today...Please let us know where the check should be sent. Also, please be aware 
the check will be written from Jeffrey's Enhanced Education entity. 
> > 
» Thank you, 
> > 
>> Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein 
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