From: Lesley Groff *_-f*
To: Rich Kahn <] -
Subject: Re: [ Apple Air computer
Date: Tue, 15 Nov 2016 19:43:01 +0000

ereat. thanks

On Nov 15, 2016, at 2:41 PM, Richard Kahn *f_ wrote:

ok will do
will confirm tomorrow when ordered
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306

fax 646-350-0954

cell 917-414-7584

On Nov 15, 2016, at 2:39 PM, || G <

see below!

Begin forwarded message:

From: "jeffrey E." < >
Subject: Re: Apple Air computer

Date: November 15, 2016 at 2:38:08 PM EST
To: Lesley Groff <

Send to valdson

(On Tuesday, 15 November 2016, Lesley Groff H_l wrote:

Rich has identified 2-3 laptops for -...51i1| waiting on more feedback from James. OK to ask for

B address to send it to?

On Nov 13, 2016, at 11:06 AM, jeffrey E. {_‘* wrote:

geta 13 inapple air . used ok. send to -

please note
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