
From: Lesley Groff 

To: Richard Kahn < 

Subject: Re: Gotham Awards 

Date: Mon, 21 Nov 2016 14:34:19 +0000 

Let me know if Jeffrey doesn't answer you I can ask him again 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 21, 2016, at 8:29 AM, Richard Kahn 

please advise if ok to pay 
if so in the past we have paid via enhanced education 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

wrote: 

On Nov 20, 2016, at 11:12 AM, Lesley Groff < wrote: 

FYI 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Peggy Siegal < 
Date: November 20, 2016 at 9:55:32 AM EST 
To: Jeffrey Epstein < 
Cc: Rebecca Drescher 
Subject: Gotham Awards 

>, Joana Vicente < 

Lesley...I just got off the phone with Jeffrey. 

EFTA00439543



He has agreed to once again help out the Gotham Awards, a gala on Monday, Nov. 28th at Cipriani's 
downtown, to raise money for independent film makers. 

Jeffrey underwrites $10,000 for renting ballroom chairs at the gala. 

Joana Vincente will send an invoice for the Gala chairs this week. 

We are all so appreciative of his support and generosity. Jeffrey also knows he is so welcome to 
attend....but is usually out of town. 

Again....we all thank Jeffrey so much. 
The Gala will once again look elegant and chic. 
xoxo Peggy Siegal 
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