
From: Richard Kahn • 
To: Merwin Dela Cruz 

Cc: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: thank you 

Date: Tue, 22 Nov 2016 14:17:29 +0000 

ok thank you 
no need to chase her 
she has left 301 apts? 

we should change code of her apt.. 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Nov 22, 2016, at 9:16 AM, Merwin Dela cruz < > wrote: 

She did not send her complete hours yet. I texted and left her a voicemail to remind her yesterday and she 
respond ok. 

\krwin Dela Cruz 

On Nov 22, 2016, at 9:02 AM, Richard Kahn > wrote: 

did you ever send hours and approval? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

EFTA00439630



Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Re:thank you 
Date: November 18, 2016 at 5:50:29 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn 

Thank you for your help. 
Although did not work, it was a great experience! 
Wish you all the best. 

On Nov 18, 2016 15:02, "Richard Kahn" <1 
yes monday we can send wire or deposit with bank - your choice 
sorry things did not work out 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Nov 18, 2016, at 2:51 PM, 

> wrote: 

wrote: 

Thank you. I also want to know if I need to sign anything since I'm leaving the job. 
Is it possible to get the check deposited in my account instead of pick it up? 

On Nov 18, 2016 14:45, "Richard Kahn" < > wrote: 
i am sorry to hear that 
did you send your hours to merwin for the week? 
i am leaving early today so we can mail check or you can pick up monday 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

EFTA00439631



On Nov 18, 2016, at 2:33 PM, wrote: 

Hi Richard, I don't know if you already know, but today will be my last day of work, and I would 
like to know if I need to stop by the office to upgrade my situation, once I will be leaving. 
I still have a week payment to receive, and I could atop by. 
thank you 
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