
From: 

To: Bella Klein <a> 

Subject: Fwd: return for Karyna on Thursday now.. [Incident: 161216-000587] 

Date: Wed. 25 Jan 2017 13:10:55 +0000 

Ilere you Go! We should get a refund for the Aero0ot...she says it may take up to 2 billing cycles... 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 'Natalia Molotkova" < 
Subject: return for on Thursday now.. (Incident: 161216-000587] 
Date: December 15. 2016 at 2:31:39 PM EST 
To: 
Reply-To: -Natalia Molotkova" 

US Centurion Banner 

Refund might take up to two billing cycles. 

Regards. 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationshi Mane er 

Hours: Mon. Wed 9a-4p. 530p-7p 
Tue, Thur. Fri 9a - 530p EST 

YES! issue refundable fare! t hanks 

On Dec 15. 2016: at 2:29 PM. Natalia Molotkova ca wrote: 

Nope. not big difference - $7158.16. ok issue refundable? 

Regards. 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Mana er 

Hours: Mon. Wed 9a-4p. 530p-7p 
Tue. Thur. Fri 9a - 530p EST 

what is the cost of the fully refundable...just curious!? if not a huge difference maybe we do it as Karyna thinks the return could change... 

On Dec 15. 2016: at 1:50 PM. Natalia Molotkova •i: > wrote: 

This ticket is APPROVED...please change Karyna to these flights! 

On Dec 15. 2016: at 1:50 PM. Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

EFTA00443766



ok. thanks for this...let me show JE and Karyna... 

On Dec 15. 2016. at 1:50 PM. Natalia Molotkova 'mote: 

1 LO 
1 B2 
business 

27 16DEC JFK WAW 1030P 1245P 
896 17DEC WAW MSQ 0300P 0610P - this only leg coach, no availability in 

2 LO 706 22DEC MSQ WAW 0355P 0310P 
2 LO 26 22DEC WAW JFK 0505P 0840P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 7083.16 

Regards. 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationshi Mana er 

Hours: Mon. Wed 9a-4p. 530p-7p 
Tue, Thur. Fri 9a - 530p EST 

and please check return for Karyna on Thursday 22nd...the flights that would match up with the LOT flights...1st class...let me know price also...thanks 
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