
From: Lany Visoski <Ila> 
To: Bella Klein  
Cc: >, Richard Kahn <1 

Subject: Re: ATT Invoice 
Date: Tue, 07 Feb 2017 18:13:33 +0000 

I called the number,. A young lady answered,. 
I don't recognize the number, I gave Larry Morrison my old iPhone 5 so there was no cost 2 years ago,. 
Maybe that phone charge was when I upgraded my phone to iPhone 6?. But I think that phone number is tied to 
that iPhone 6, I don't recognize that number at all in my address book 
Thx 
Lany 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 7, 2017, at 2:08 PM, Bella Klein < wrote: 

Please check if the number below is in your address book, not in mine.. 
Lany, did you authorize a new iPhone for Larry, why should we pay balance if he keeps device. Please advise 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Larry Visoski < > 
Subject: Fwd: ATT Invoice 
Date: February 7, 2017 at 1:01:48 PM  EST 
To: Bella Klein <I 

Hi Bella„ 
From Larry Morrison, invoice,. 

There is a phone number what is tied to my old ATT account,. 
I don't recognize the number and when I call it a female answers,. 
Not sure if we are paying for this,. Or it's fraud?? 
Can you check with ATT? 
According to Larry Morrison there is a balance owed for new IPhone 6 of $250 remaining,. Not my phone„ 
It could be a JE assistant girl phone,. But not to my knowledge,. Can you assist please, when you have a 
moment? 

Thx 
Larry V 
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Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: Februa 7, 2017 at 1:45:29 PM AST 
To: 
Subject: Fwd: ATT Invoice 

Hi Lar, 
Attached is the ATT Invoice for the installment plan in question. Let me know if the attachment didn't come through Ok. 
Thank you. 

--Original Mess 
From: jetcare 
To: Ivjet 
Sent Tue, Jan 31, 2017 11:09 am 
Subject: ATT Invoice 

Good Morning Lar, 

I hope all is well. How do you wish to handle the attached? Apparently when I transferred over my cell phone to my 
family plan there was an installment plan for an (Phone 6 (which is not my phone) attached to the account that I was not 
made aware of prior. I do not wish to disrupt anyone's service. If you wish to send me a check for the Balance 
remaining I'll just continue to make the remaining payments until it is a $0 balance. 
Let me know. 

Thanks, 
Larry 

<ATT.pdf> 
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