
From: Daphne Wallace <I 
To: 

Cc: Rich Kahn < >, Janusz Banasiak < 

Subject: Re: Chaise Lounge Invoice-Daphne is handling! 
Date: Tue, 14 Feb 2017 15:25:29 +0000 

Attachments: mime_part_Lpdf 

Greetings JB, 

Please see attached invoice for the chaises. 

Kind regards, DW 

On Tue, Feb 14, 2017 at 9:38 AM, > wrote: 
Rich, I spoke with Daphne re the chaise lounge chairs that were purchased through Amazon and she will 
handle getting an invoice put together... 

Just wanted you to know... 
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