
From 
To: Bebe Avdiu 

Cc: Bella Klein 

Subject: Re: Seamless not working? 
Date: Wed, 15 Feb 2017 18:40:09 +0000 

maybe I needed to log out and log back in? not really sure... 

On Feb 15, 2017, at 1:39 PM, Bebe 
Avdit vmte: 

weird ... I looked into the settings and everything looks fine ... MC ending in ■, exp 11119 last used 
yesterday, Feb 14, 2017 at 12:11pm. Not sure why it didn't work for you? 

Bebe Avdiu 
Legal Assistant 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
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On Feb 15, 2017, at 12:25 PM, wrote: 

HI Bebe...trying to place an order with Seemless and it says the payment info is not working...? I show an 
MC ending in exp. I1/19...did somethkng change? 

I just called you but you were not at your desk... 

EFTA00445356


