From: Bebe Avdiu [

Ce: Bella Klein [

Subject: Re: Seamless not working?

Date: Wed, 15 Feb 2017 18:42:06 +0000

it's something |

Bebe Avdiu

Legal Assistant

DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
Mew York, New York 10022
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attornev-client privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee.
It 15 the property of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If vou have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication

and all copies thereof, including all attachments.
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e 3t e e sfe e s s e ofe e s 3 e ofe ofe e 3 sfe e sfesfe 3 s e e ofe e s 3 o ofe ofe e 3 spe e ofe e e s e ofesfe s 3 e ofe e e s e ofe e ofe e e e e sfe e o s e e e s e e e e e e e e e sfe e e e
depe ek

On Feb 15, 2017, at 1:41 PM, Bebe Avdiu ||| G ot

hmm ... maybe?

Don’t ask for the password be [ have no clue lol it’s just saved to my computer

Bebe Avdiu

Legal Assistant

DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC
:lhq I.Lh.jl'l;_[l'.:l:'l. .II'I.II C1IUE, -1".]! ]:ll.:ll.:l'l'

Mew York, New York 10022
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The information contained in this communication 15 confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, and is intended only for the use of the
addressee.

It is the property of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly
prohibited

and may be unlawful. If vou have received this communication in errfor, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication

and all copies thereof, including all attachments.
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On Feb 15, 2017, at 1:40 PM_ wrote:

maybe [ needed to log out and log back in? not really sure. ..

On Feb 15, 2017, at 1:39 PM, Bebe Avdiu | o

weird ... [ looked into the settings and everything looks fine ... MC ending in 9256, exp 11/19 last used
vesterday, Feb 14, 2017 at 12:11pm. Not sure why it didn’t work for you?

Bebe Avdiu
Legal Assistant
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
Mew York, New York 10022
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on Feb 15,2017, at 12:25 pM ||| | T -

HI Bebe. . .trying to place an order with Seemless and it says the payment info is not working...? [ show
an MC ending in xp. 11/19...did somethkng change?

I just called you but you were not at your desk...

EFTA00445362



