
From: Appointment cala 

To:
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

Date: Wed, 15 Mar 2017 23:06:01 +0000 

Hi 

So sorry for my delay! We were closed early on Monday and then yesterday because of the snow 
- today was all catch up! I will have this for you (waiting on accounting) no later than 
Friday. 

Hope you're well 

Best, 

Angie 

@dangene 
Dangene: The Institute of Skinovation 
66 E 55th Street, 6th Floor 
Between Park and Madison 
South Side of the Street 
New York, NY 10022 

<mailto: 

On 3/15/17, 12:49 PM, wrote: 

Hi Angie...hope you made it through the storm! Yuk...so ready for Spring! 

Can you send me invoices for -
w/Sam.. 

_mine as well from Feb 7th with Sam... 

:) thanks! 

two appointments March 6th w/Dangene and March 7th 

> On Mar 10, 2017, at 3:29 PM, Appointment > wrote: 

> • Hi 

> Just wanted to let you know I am in receipt of this! I am out of the office but I can 
get this to you on Monday if that's okay? 

> • Best, 

> • Angie 

> @dangene 
> Dangene: The Institute of Skinovation 
> 66 E 55th Street, 6th Floor 
> Between Park and Madison 
> South Side of the Street 
> New York, NY 10022 

<mailto:

> on 3/10/17, 2:39 PM, wrote: 

EFTA00447222



Hi Angie! Our accounting dept. has asked that I help in the process of keeping 

track of Jeffrey's `package' he just purchased...I know Elina met with Dangene on Monday and 

Sam on Tuesday ...can you forward me the debit's (statement?) for these appointments? 

Thanks! 

EFTA00447223


