From: Appointment
To: Lesley Groff
Subject: Re: Invoice

Date: Tue. 21 Mar 2017 12:24:44 +0000

Hi Lesley,

No problem — this actually represents 5 sessions. The first was used 3/6 as per the very first invoice (if you need | can
forward again). There will be another for you this week, as we are seeing her on 3/23. Let me know if you have any
guestions.

Best,

Angie

@dangene

Dangene: The Institute of Skinovation
66 E 55th Street, 6th Floor

Between Park and Madison

South Side of the Street

New York, NY 10022

From: Lesley Groff <
Date: Tuesday, March 21, 2017 at 8:14 AM

Subject: Re: Invoice

EFTA00447791



Hi Angie! This 1s perfect!.. So I have it straight, this invoice represents 3 sessions. .. We have 46 of 52 sessions
remaining._.can yvou forward the invoice for the other 3 sessions we are deducting from Jeffrey’s package? [ need
to keep all in a folder together. . .No rush.. just need...

thank you! Lesley

On Mar 17, 2017, at 7:08 PM, Appointment q~_ wrote:

Hello Lesley,

I hope this email finds vou well. As per your request, attached is the invoice.
Please let me know if vou have any questions.

Best,

Angie

dangene

Dangene: The Institute of Skinovation

66 E 55th Street, 6th Floor

Between Park and Madison

South Side of the Street

MNew York, NY 10022

<INVOICEMARCH.doex>
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