
From: "Natalia Molotkova"

To: ' < 

Subject: Can you please check the Valencia again... 

Date: Tue, 23 May 2017 14:34:03 +0000 

L,2,LIS Centurion Banner 

Will keep checking... 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon, Wed 9a-4p, 530p-7p 
Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST 

OK, deposit one night, cancellation 2 days. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon, Wed 9a-4p, 530p-7p 
Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST 

great. thanks 

On May 23, 2017, at 10:25 AM, Natalia Molotkova < > wrote: 

so another king room...still no suite...darn...YES, book just in case...thanks 

On May 23, 2017, at 10:30 AM, Natalia Molotkova < > wrote: 

EFTA00452393



VINTAGE KING OCEAN.1K - 269.65 plus tax 

OK to book? 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon, Wed 9a-4p, 530p-7p 
I Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST 

Checking. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon, Wed 9a-4p, 530p-7p 
Tue, Thur, Fri 9a - 530p EST 

Thank you for your email. I am currently out of the office. 

Morning! Can you please check the Valencia again and see if anything else may have come available for June 6-
8? 
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